Fc‘

Y
y

I

\

THE NEWFOUNDLAND
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE

PART I
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. 99 ST. JOHN’S, FRIDAY, MAY 31, 2024 No. 22

CHANGE OF NAME ACT, 2009

Under the authority vested in me by the Change of Name Act, 2009, SNL2009 cC-8-1, I hereby certify the following
names have been changed.

Former Surname Former Given Name(s) Surname Given Name(s) City / Town
BABIIENKO DMYTRO MOTSAR DAVID ST. JOHN'S

APPLIN BARBARA CICELY CHANELLE APPLIN CHANELLE SANDY COVE

ATURE HADIYA RASHEED ATURE HADIYA ADUPOKA RASHEED CORNER BROOK
BABIIENKO ARTEM MOTSAR ERIC ST. JOHN'S

CHO YOONSUNG JO DANIEL ST. JOHN'S

CROWSON ISLA AMELIA CROWSON AYLA AMELIA ST. JOHN'S

DISHART DAVIN RICHARD-ROBERT MICHELIN DAVIN RICHARD ROBERT HAPPY VALLEY-GOOSE BAY
DOVE ELSIE RUBY DIANE DOVE DIANE ELSIE RUBY BISHOP'S FALLS

DYKE MARY ANNE ELIZABETH CHRISTINE DYKE MORGAN AVERY MOUNT PEARL

ELTON LEE-ANNE DANIELLE ELTON LEE-ANNA LOUVE ST. JOHN'S

FEAVER HENRY CLAYTON FEAVER CLAYTON HENRY BURGEO

GELDENHUYS ETHAN LOURENS SNELGROVE ETHAN LOURENS EMBREE

HAMILTON MICHELLE DAWN HAMILTON MICHELLE GRAND FALLS-WINDSOR
HAND NORAH BELLE HAND NORAH BELLE MADONNA ST. JOHN'S

HEALEY BRIAN JAMES CROSS BRIAN JAMES PARADISE

HICKEY ISAIAH KEVIN DENNIS HACKETT ISAIAH KEVIN DENNIS ST. JOHN'S

MACDONALD LYLA REBECCA LEGGO LYLA REBECCA CORNER BROOK

MEADE JOSEPH CONNOR MEADE JOEY BLAKE CONCEPTION BAY SOUTH
OSBOURNE-EARLE KRISTIN DIANE EARLE KRISTIN DIANE ST. JOHN'S

ULLAH SAYED SHAFIQ AHMADI TANYA ST. JOHN'S

WADE MARY ANN Joy MARY ANN CONCEPTION BAY

WILLS JONATHAN BERNARD WILLS LENA BERNARD CORNER BROOK

Dated this 21* day of May, 2024. DIGITAL GOVERNMENT & SERVICE NL

Sheena Gough, Registrar of Vital Statistics
May 31

209



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

MINERAL ACT

NOTICE

Published in accordance with section 62 of CNLR
1143/96 under the Mineral Act, cM-12, RSNL 1990

as amended.

Mineral rights to the following mineral licenses have
reverted to the Crown:

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by
Mineral License

held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

23772M
Wilson J. Jacobs

24715M
Lloyd Pike

25500M
Darrin Hicks

25700M
Puddle Pond Resources Inc.

266382M
85431 Newfoundland
and Labrador Inc.

27515M
Wayde Guinchard

27517
Wayde Guinchard

27610M
Canstar Resources Inc.

27612M
Darrin Hicks

27618M
Tom McLennon

30911M

Golden Planet Mining Corp.

31565M
Shawn Ryan

31571IM
Darrin Hicks

31591M
Shawn Ryan

210

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

31599M
Puddle Pond Resources Inc,

31637M
Golden Planet Mining Corp.

31822M
Garfield Keats

31823M
Garfield Keats

31833M
United Gold Inc.

31838M
Kevin D. Keats

31954M
Ross Collier

31962M
Mike Noseworthy

31971M
Mike Noseworthy

31974M
Mike Noseworthy

31985M
Mike Noseworthy

32082M
Wayde Guinchard

32083M
Peter Rogers

32086M
Wayde Guinchard

32088M
Wayde Guinchard

32091M
Wayde Guinchard

33664M
Warwick Gold Limited

33665M
Warwick Gold Limited

33680M
Georges Reid



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

33682M
Georges Reid

33683M
Shawn Ryan

33759M
Annie Rose

33952M
Russell Lawlor

33959M
Jocelyn Moore

34021M
George J. Mercer

34199M
Clyde McLean

34593M
Brian Jones

35070M
Kevin Ryan

35230M
Shawn Ryan

35277TM
Wayde Guinchard

35280M
Shoreline Exploration Inc.

35282M
Alexander J. Turpin

35284M
Spearmint Resources Inc.

35285M
Lester Hussey

35286M
Lester Hussey

35340M
Volta Lithium Pty Ltd.

35341M
Volta Lithium Pty Ltd.

35342M
Volta Lithium Pty Ltd.

211

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

Mineral License
held by

35343M
United Gold Inc.

35384M
David Hicks

35385M
Natalie Hicks

35388M
Jamie Osmond

35390M
David Keating

35392M
Ronald Sweetapple

35394M
Barbara Pike

35436M
George Lannon

35594M
Jeffrey Brushett

35912M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35926M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35927M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35928M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35930M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35931M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35932M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)

35933M
Big Ridge Gold Corp (51%)/
Coastal Gold Corp (49%)



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

Mineral License  36723M

held by Jason White
Mineral License  36724M

held by Jason White
Mineral License  36966M

held by Edge Exploration
Mineral License  37703M

held by Brian Jones

The lands covered by this notice except for the lands
within Exempt Mineral Lands, the Exempt Mineral
Lands being described in CNLR 1143/96 and NLR
71/98, 104/98, 97/2000, 36/2001, 31/2004, 78/2006,
8/2008, 28/2009, 5/2013, 3/2017, 12/22 and 76/23 and
outlined on 1:50 000 scale digital maps maintained by
the Department of Industry, Energy and Technology,
will be open for staking after the hour of 9:00 a.m. on
the 32nd clear day after the date of this publication.

DEPARTMENT OF INDUSTRY,
ENERGY AND TECHNOLOGY
Trina Adams, Mineral Claims Recorder

May 31

URBAN AND RURAL
PLANNING ACT, 2000

NOTICE OF REGISTRATION
TOWN OF CONCEPTION BAY SOUTH
MUNICIPAL PLAN
AMENDMENT NO. 32, 2024
DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS
AMENDMENT NO. 51, 2024

TAKE NOTICE thatthe TOWN OF CONCEPTION
BAY SOUTH Municipal Plan Amendment 32, 2024
and Development Regulations Amendment No. 51,
2024, adopted by the Town Council on March 5%,
2024, has been registered by the Minister of Municipal
and Provincial Affairs.

IN GENERAL TERMS, Conception Bay South
Municipal Plan Amendment No. 32, 2024 and
Development Regulations Amendment No. 51, 2024
re-designates and re-zones land at 1440 Conception
Bay Highway from the “Residential Low Density”
and “Residential Mixed Use” to “Commercial Light
Industrial” designation and zone.

Conception Bay South Municipal Pan Amendment
No. 32, 2024 and Development Regulations
Amendment No. 51, 2024 come into legal effect on the

212

day that this notice is published in the Newfoundland
and Labrador Gazette. A copy of the registered
amendment is available at the Town of Conception
Bay South Town Hall.

TOWN OF CONCEPTION BAY SOUTH
Corrie Davis, Director—Planning and Development

May 31

LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 ¢36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry
and Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant to
section 7(2) (d) of the said Act, to that piece of Crown
lands situated within 15 metres of the waters of St.
Alban’s Harbour, Bay d’Espoir, for the purpose of
erecting a storage building and deploying a floating
wharf.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline
of the above mentioned water body(s) in various
locations. For a detailed map, please see website:
https://www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the
date of application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must
file the objection in writing with reasons, within 30
days from the publication of notice on the Department
of Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown
Lands, https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the
Minister of Department of Fisheries, Forestry and
Agriculture by mail or email to the nearest Regional
Lands Office:

e FEastern Regional Lands Office,
P.O. Box 8700, Howley Building,
Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, AIB 4J6

Email: easternlandsoffice(@gov.nl.ca

e Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222,
Gander, NL, A1V 2N9

Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,
A2H 6J8 Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

e Labrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014,
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, AOP 1EO

Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador
Gaczette publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received
from the Applicant and takes no responsibility for
errors or omissions in the property being more
particularly described.)

May 31

LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 ¢36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry
and Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant
to section 7(2) (d) of the said Act, to that piece of
Crown lands situated within 15 metres of the waters
of Carbonear Harbour, for the purpose of residential
use; kayak tie up and seating for resting/sight seeing.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline
of the above mentioned water body(s) in various
locations. For a detailed map, please see website:
https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the
date of application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must
file the objection in writing with reasons, within 30
days from the publication of notice on the Department
of Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown
Lands, https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the
Minister of Department of Fisheries, Forestry and
Agriculture by mail or email to the nearest Regional
Lands Office:

e FEastern Regional Lands Office,
P.O. Box 8700, Howley Building,
Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, AIB 4J6

Email: easternlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222,
Gander, NL, A1V 2N9

Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,
A2H 6J8 Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

e [abrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014,
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, AOP 1EO
Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

213

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador
Gazette publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received
from the Applicant and takes no responsibility for
errors or omissions in the property being more
particularly described.)

May 31

LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 ¢36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry
and Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant to
section 7(2) (d) of the said Act, to that piece of Crown
lands situated within 15 metres of the waters of
Creston Inlet, Marystown for the purpose of existing
residential garage and construct wharf/boathouse.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline
of the above mentioned water body(s) in various
locations. For a detailed map, please see website:
https://www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the
date of application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must
file the objection in writing with reasons, within 30
days from the publication of notice on the Department
of Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown
Lands, https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the
Minister of Department of Fisheries, Forestry and
Agriculture by mail or email to the nearest Regional
Lands Office:

e FEastern Regional Lands Office,
P.O. Box 8700, Howley Building,
Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, AIB 4J6

Email: easternlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222,
Gander, NL, A1V 2N9

Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,
A2H 6J8 Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

e Labrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014,
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, AOP 1EO
Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca




THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador
Gazette publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received
from the Applicant and takes no responsibility for
errors or omissions in the property being more
particularly described.)

May 31

LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 ¢36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry
and Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant
to section 7(2) (d) of the said Act, to that piece of
Crown lands situated within 15 metres of the waters
of Hogans Pond, located in Portugal Cove-St. Philip’s
for the purpose of building a wharf.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline
of the above mentioned water body(s) in various
locations. For a detailed map, please see website:
https://www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the
date of application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must
file the objection in writing with reasons, within 30
days from the publication of notice on the Department
of Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown
Lands, https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the
Minister of Department of Fisheries, Forestry and
Agriculture by mail or email to the nearest Regional
Lands Office:

e FEastern Regional Lands Office,
PO. Box 8700, Howley Building,
Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, AIB 4J6

Email: easternlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222,
Gander, NL, A1V 2N9

Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,
A2H 6J8 Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

e Labrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014,
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, AOP 1EO
Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

214

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador
Gaczette publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received
from the Applicant and takes no responsibility for
errors or omissions in the property being more
particularly described.)

May 31

LANDS ACT

NOTICE OF INTENT, SECTION 7
LANDS ACT, SNL1991 ¢36 AS AMENDED

NOTICE IS HEREBY given that an application has
been made to the Department of Fisheries, Forestry
and Agriculture Branch, to acquire title, pursuant to
section 7(2) (d) of the said Act, to that piece of Crown
lands situated within 15 metres of the waters of
Woody Point, around Woody Point Anchorage area,
for the purpose of building a boat house and wharf.

The application may intrude on the 15 metre shoreline
of the above mentioned water body(s) in various
locations. For a detailed map, please see website:
https://www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/sec7notifications/.

Please note: It may take up to five (5) days from the
date of application for details to appear on the website.

Any person wishing to object to the application must
file the objection in writing with reasons, within 30
days from the publication of notice on the Department
of Fisheries, Forestry and Agriculture website, Crown
Lands, https:/www.gov.nl.ca/ffa/lands/, to the
Minister of Department of Fisheries, Forestry and
Agriculture by mail or email to the nearest Regional
Lands Office:

e FEastern Regional Lands Office,
P.O. Box 8700, Howley Building,
Higgins Line, St. John’s, NL, AIB 4J6

Email: easternlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Central Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2222,
Gander, NL, A1V 2N9

Email: centrallandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

e Western Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 2006,
Sir Richard Squires Building, Corner Brook, NL,
A2H 6J8 Email: westernregionlands@gov.nl.ca

e [abrador Regional Lands Office, P.O. Box 3014,
Station “B”, Happy Valley-Goose Bay, NL, AOP 1EO
Email: labradorlandsoffice@gov.nl.ca

(DISCLAIMER: The Newfoundland and Labrador




THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

Gazette publishes a NOTICE OF INTENT as received
from the Applicant and takes no responsibility for
errors or omissions in the property being more
particularly described.)

May 31

TRUSTEE ACT
ESTATE NOTICE

IN THE MATTER OF the Estate of CORNELIA
FRANCINA MEYER, late of Shubenacadie in the
Province of Nova Scotia, formerly of St. John’s,
Newfoundland and Labrador, Deceased.

ALL PERSONS claiming to be creditors of or who
have any claims or demands upon or affecting the
Estate of CORNELIA FRANCINA MEYER, late of
Shubenacadie, Nova Scotia, formerly of St. John’s,
Newfoundland and Labrador, who died at Truro, Nova
Scotia on April 9, 2023, are hereby requested to send
the particulars of the same in writing, duly attested,
to the undersigned Solicitor for the Administrator
of the Estate on or before the 28 day of June 2024,
after which date the said Administrator will proceed
to distribute the said Estate having regard only to the
claims of which notice shall have been received.

DATED at Truro, Nova Scotia this 15" day of May
2024,

BURCHELL MACDOUGALL LLP
Solicitor for the Administrator
Per: Linda R. Hupman

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
P.O. Box 1128

710 Prince Street

Truro, NS B2N 5H1

Tel: (902) 896-4566
Fax: 1 (866) 774-1072
May 31

ESTATE NOTICE

IN THE ESTATE OF JOYCE HEATHER OWERS,
of St. John’s, in the Province of Newfoundland and
Labrador, Deceased.

ALL PERSONS CLAIMING to be creditors of, or
who have any claims or demands upon or affecting, the
Estate of the late Joyce Heather Owers, of St. John’s,
in the Province of Newfoundland and Labrador,

215

Deceased, are hereby requested to send particulars
thereof in writing, duly attested, to the undersigned
Solicitor for the Executrix of the said deceased, on or
before the 13" day of June, 2024, after which date the
Executrix will proceed to distribute the said Estate
having regard only to the claim(s) of which she then
shall have had notice.

DATED at Carbonear, in the Province of
Newfoundland and Labrador, this 13th day of May,
2024,

BABB LAW OFFICE
Solicitor for the Executrix
Per: Jessica M. Babb, B.A., J.D.

ADDRESS FOR SERVICE:
PO Box 400

18 Goff Avenue

Carbonear, NL A1Y 1BS8

Tel: (709) 596-2377

Toll Free:  1-800-596-0596

Fax: (709) 596-0415
e-mail: babblaw@babblaw.ca
May 31







THE NEWFOUNDLAND
AND LABRADOR GAZETTE

PART 11
SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION
FILED UNDER THE STATUTES AND SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION ACT

Vol. 99 ST. JOHN’S, FRIDAY, MAY 31, 2024

No. 22

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR
REGULATIONS

NLR 32/24
NLR 33/24






NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR
REGULATION 32/24

Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment)
under the
Criminal Code
(0O.C. 2024-075)

(Filed May 31, 2024)

Under the authority granted by the Lieutenant-Governor in
Council by Minute in Council 1081-82 and subsection 207(2) of the
Criminal Code, the Lieutenant-Governor in Council makes the
following regulations.

Dated at St. John’s, May 31, 2024.

Krista Quinlan
Clerk of the Executive Council

REGULATIONS

Analysis

. S.2 Amdt.

Definitions

. S3R&S

Issuing of licence

. S./4 Amdt.

Refusal of licence

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette

. S.8.1 Added

Policies and procedures

. S.9 Amdt.

Exception

. S.10 Amdt.

Other schemes

May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

7. S.11 Amdt. 14. S.35 R&S
Appeal Licence period
8. S.20 Amdt. 15. S.36 R&S
Licensee's financial records Conduct, management and
9. S.22 Amdt. operation
Removal of books, etc. 16. Sch. A Amdt.
10. S.23 Amdt. 17. Sch. C Amdt.
Audited statements 18. Sch. D R&S
11. S.25 Amdt. 19. Sch. E Amdt.
Equipment 20. Sch. F. Amdt.
12. S.25.1 Added 21. Sch. G Amdt.
Use of electronic gaming 22. Transitional
equipment 23. Commencement
13. S.28 R&S

Contracts or agreements
NLR 1/02 1. (1) Paragraph 2(a) of the Lottery Licensing Regulations is
as amended amended by deleting the words "Department of Tourism, Culture
and Recreation" and substituting the words '"department
responsible for sport".

(2) Paragraphs 2(b) and (c) of the regulations are repealed
and the following substituted:

(b) "charitable or religious object or purpose" includes objects
or purposes that

(i) promote the relief of
(A) poverty, or
(B) the consequences of poverty,

(ii) promote the advancement of education, including the
advancement of literacy,

(iii) promote the advancement of religion, or

(iv) are for other charitable purposes beneficial to the
community;

(c) "charitable or religious organization" means an organization
having solely charitable or religious objects or purposes and
which performs services solely for public good or welfare
without direct or indirect profit or pecuniary gain to its
members and includes the following:

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 326 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(i) a charitable organization registered under the Income
Tax Act (Canada),

(i1) a company incorporated for a charitable or religious
object or purpose under the Corporations Act, and

(iii) an unincorporated organization, association or group
that is formed for a charitable or religious object or

purpose;

(3) Section 2 of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after paragraph (c) the following:

(c.1) "counterfoil" means an electronic record or paper ticket stub
which will be manually drawn to determine a winner and
contains a single draw number matching the draw number on
a player's ticket purchased by the player;

(c.2) "department" means the department presided over by the
minister;

(4) Paragraphs 2(d) and (e) of the regulations are repealed
and the following substituted:

(d) "director" means the director of the division responsible for
charitable lottery licensing;

(e) "division" means the division of the department responsible
for the administration of charitable lottery licensing;

(5) Section 2 of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after paragraph (e) the following:

(e.1) "electronic gaming equipment" means any computer
hardware or software used for the sale of a ticket, selection
of a winner or distribution of a prize in an electronic ticket
lottery;

(6) Paragraph 2(p) of the regulations is repealed and the
following substituted:

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 327 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(p) "purpose beneficial to the community" means an activity or
benefit to the public or some significantly large section of it
and includes

(i) amateur sport and recreation,

(ii) the promotion, advancement and preservation of the
arts, culture and heritage,

(iii) youth and seniors activities, and

(iv) the enhancement of health and welfare and public
safety; and

(7) Paragraph 2(q) of the regulations is amended by deleting
the words ""Department of Tourism, Culture and Recreation" and
substituting the words ""department responsible for recreation.

2. Section 3 of the regulations is repealed and the following
substituted:

Issuing of licence 3. The division may issue a licence where
(a) the applicant
(i) is a charitable or religious organization and the proceeds
of the lottery shall be expended on a charitable or
religious object or purpose, or
(i1) is an incorporated non-profit organization raising funds
solely for charitable or religious objects or purposes;
and
(b) other licensing requirements have been met.
3. Section 4 of the regulations is amended by deleting the word
"or" at the end of paragraph (b), deleting the period at the end of
paragraph (c) and substituting a semi-colon and the word "or'" and

adding immediately after paragraph (c) the following:

d) where the applicant no longer meets the requirements
pp g q
prescribed in section 3.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 328 May 31, 2024



Policies and
procedures

Exception

Other schemes

Licensee's financial
records

Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

4. The regulations are amended by adding immediately after
section 8 the following:

8.1 The director may establish policies and procedures related to the
conduct, management and operation of a lottery scheme.

5. Subsection 9(1) of the regulations is repealed and the
following substituted:

9. (1) Notwithstanding a term or condition prescribed in these
regulations, the division may issue a licence to the Health Care
Foundation to permit the conduct and management of a breakopen
lottery scheme through hotels, motels, lounges and taverns which have
been licensed under section 27 of the Liquor Control Act subject to a
signed agreement between the Health Care Foundation and Hospitality
Newfoundland and Labrador, providing this agreement contains
elements of control, accountability and other relevant measures and is
acceptable to the division.

6. Subsection 10(1) of the regulations is repealed and the
following substituted:

10. (1) The division may license a lottery scheme other than a
lottery scheme prescribed in sections 39 to 45.

7. Section 11 of the regulations is amended by

(a) deleting the word "division" and substituting the word
"director or division'"; and

(b) deleting the words "Trial Division" and substituting the
words "Supreme Court".

8. Subsection 20(1) of the regulations is repealed and the
following substituted:

20. (1) A licensee shall maintain financial records that relate to the
licensed lottery scheme.

9. (1) Section 22 of the regulations is amended by deleting the
word '"division" wherever it appears and substituting the word
"director".

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 329 May 31, 2024



Use of electronic
gaming equipment

Contracts or
agreements

Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(2) Subsection 22(2) of the regulations is amended by
deleting the words "the licence" and substituting the words "the
licensee'.

10. Section 23 of the regulations is amended by deleting the
word "division" wherever it appears and substituting the word
"director".

11. Section 25 of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after subsection (2) the following:

(3) Subsection (1) does not apply to electronic gaming
equipment.

12. The regulations are amended by adding immediately after
section 25 the following:

25.1 (1) A licensee shall not use electronic gaming equipment to
conduct, manage and operate an electronic ticket lottery unless the
electronic gaming equipment complies with the policy for electronic
gaming equipment established by the director.

(2) A licensee shall not install, move, maintain, modify or repair
or permit the installation, movement, maintenance, modification or
repair of the electronic gaming equipment referred to in subsection (1)
without the director's approval.

(3) A licensee shall not permit a player to use electronic gaming
equipment to participate in an electronic ticket lottery where the
electronic gaming equipment has been altered in a way that could affect

(a) its integrity, safety, security or reporting capability; or

(b) the outcome or pay-out of the electronic ticket lottery.

13. Section 28 of the regulations is repealed and the following
substituted:

28. (1) A licensee shall not enter into a contract or agreement,
written or verbal, implied or stated, for the supply or purchase of goods
or services, unless the method of payment is pre-determined.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 330 May 31, 2024



Licence period

Conduct,
management and
operation

Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(2) Where the method of payment is percentage based, the
percentage shall not exceed 15 percent of gross receipts.

(3) Notwithstanding subsection (2), the percentage in relation to
ticket sales shall not exceed 20 percent of the ticket sales.

14. Section 35 of the regulations is repealed and the following
substituted"

35. (1) A licence period shall not exceed 12 months.

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1), where a licence relates to a
series of lottery events, the licence period shall not exceed 24 months.

15. Section 36 of the regulations is repealed and the following
substituted:

36. (1) The conduct, management and operation of a lottery scheme
shall be the responsibility of the licensee and shall not be delegated to
another organization or person who is not a member of the licensee's
organization.

(2) A licensee may acquire assistance with the conduct,
management and operation of a lottery scheme from a person who is
not a member of the licensee's organization where that person is under
the supervision of the licensee.

16. (1) Rule 1 of schedule A of the regulations is amended by

(a) deleting the amount "$3,000" wherever it appears and
substituting the amount "$5,000"; and

(b) deleting the amount "$1,500" wherever it appears and
substituting the amount ""$2,500".

(2) Rule 11 of schedule A of the regulations is repealed and
the following substituted:

11. Jackpots shall be paid out by licensees before the end of the
licence period.

17. (1) Rule 2 of schedule C of the regulations is amended by

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 331 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(a) deleting the amount "$3,000" wherever it appears and
substituting the amount "$5,000"; and

(b) deleting the amount "$1,500" wherever it appears and
substituting the amount "$2,500".

(2) Rule 11 of schedule C of the regulations is repealed and
the following substituted:

11. Jackpots and claimed prizes shall be paid out before the end of
the licence period.

18. Schedule D of the regulations is repealed and the following
substituted:

SCHEDULE D
Rules for Ticket Lotteries

1. The total value of tickets sold for any one event shall not exceed
12 times the total retail value of the prizes.

2. For a ticket lottery to be approved there shall be a reasonable
expectation of a 50% return after expenses to the licensee.

3. For a ticket lottery with a potential prize payout of $100,000 or
more a detailed business plan shall be submitted with the
application detailing the following:

(a) advertising and marketing;

(b) details of the prize including whether the prize has been
purchased or if on consignment;

(c) ticket distribution;
(d) staffing and salaries and commissions; and
(e) budget and projected profits.

4. All tickets shall be consecutively numbered.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 332 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

5. Where the presence of the holder of a ticket is a required condition
to win, this shall be stated on the ticket and participants shall be
entitled to be present at the drawing without additional charge.

6. Discounted prices shall not be allowed for ticket sales unless there
is a method that ensures financial accountability that has been
approved by the division.

7. When a series of draws occurs according to a fixed schedule, i.e., a
cash calendar, the ticket price can be reduced based upon the
percentage of prize value remaining. Using the cash calendar as an
example, each month, the ticket price can be reduced by 1/12th.
The licensee shall state the discount procedure in the ticket rules.

8. Unsolicited tickets shall not be distributed to the public.
9. Ticket portions or shares shall not be offered for sale.

10. The value of the prize shall include the amount of any duty, taxes,
sales taxes and other costs. Prizes shall be awarded free and clear
of any mortgages, liens, or any other encumbrances.

11. The prize shall be awarded at the location of the draw, unless
otherwise stated.

12. The prize shall be valued by a qualified independent third party if
it is a collectible or antique prize purchased by or donated to the
licensee.

13. The licensee may accept cheques or credit payments, and shall be
responsible for ensuring that the proceeds from ticket sales are
validated before the prize is awarded. If the proceeds cannot be
verified for a winning ticket a subsequent draw shall take place to
award the prize.

14. (1) A licensee may operate an early bird draw.
(2) An early bird draw shall not be held unless approved by the

division and a minimum of 14 days is allotted to account for tickets
before the draw takes place.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 333 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(3) A shorter period than that provided in subrule (2) may be
approved by the division where a request is made in writing setting
out the method that will be used to ensure accountability.

(4) The ticket shall indicate the cut-off date for an early bird draw.

15. Draw dates may be changed only on written approval of the
division. Extensions shall not be granted after ticket sales have
commenced.

16. The sequence of drawing to award prizes shall be announced
before the commencement of the draw. All winning tickets shall
not be returned for future draws unless otherwise stated by the
licensee.

17. All ticket draws shall be conducted in the presence of 2 witnesses
who shall sign a confirmation of their presence for each lottery
event.

18. Where the winner is under 19 years of age, the licensee shall
deliver the prize to the winner's legal guardian.

19. Winners of prizes shall be advised of the results of the draw by
telephone, registered mail, email or in person. The notice shall
indicate how the prize is to be claimed. Prizes shall be distributed
to the winning ticket holders as soon as possible after the date of
the ticket draw.

20. For prizes over $500, the licensee shall publish and submit along
with the financial report, the winning numbers, names and
addresses of the winners of prizes.

21. Where a prize is over $500 and is not claimed within 60 days of
the draw, another draw shall be made. Where the prize is again
unclaimed, a subsequent draw shall be made within 30 days.
Unclaimed prizes after this, including unclaimed prizes with a
value of $500 or less, shall be included in the net proceeds to be
used for, or paid to the charitable or religious objects, as approved
in the application.

22. All claimed prizes shall be paid out before the end of the licence
period.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 334 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

23. Only direct expenses required to operate the ticket lottery shall be
deducted from gaming revenue.

Paper-Based Ticket Lotteries

24. Tickets shall be commercially printed where the prize value is
greater than $500.

25. (1) Each ticket shall consist of 2 sections, each severable from the
other, and the section to be delivered to the purchaser shall contain
the following:

(a) the name of licensee;

(b) the draw location and dates;

(c) the description, number and retail value of the prizes,
whether donated or purchased;

(d) the ticket number;

(e) the total number of tickets printed;
(f) the selling price of the ticket;

(g) the licence number; and

(h) the name of the printer.

(2) The section to be retained by the licensee shall contain the
following:

(a) a place for the name, address, telephone number and email
address of the purchaser;

(b) the ticket number; and
(c) the licence number.

26. For ticket lotteries where tickets are sold and the draw is conducted
on the same day at a single premises and the potential prize payout
exceeds $500, only paragraphs 25(1)(a), (d), (f), (g), (h) and
25(2)(b) shall be required.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 335 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

27. For ticket lotteries where tickets are sold and the draw is conducted
on the same day at a single premises, and the potential prize payout
does not exceed $500, only paragraphs 25(1)(d) and 25(2)(b) shall
be required. Tickets shall be retained for a period of one week after
the draw.

28. With the exception of ticket lotteries where tickets are sold and the
draw is conducted on the same day at a single premises and the
potential prize payout does not exceed $500, a draft or hand drawn
facsimile of the proposed ticket shall accompany the application
and a true copy of the ticket for each series shall be forwarded
immediately upon printing to the division.

29. The licensee shall retain all unsold tickets and stubs of sold tickets
for a period of one year from the date of the last draw.

30. The licensee shall retain, as part of its gaming records, the
purchase invoices for all tickets and the invoices shall specify the
first and last of the sequential numbers of the tickets for each type
of ticket.

FElectronic Ticket Lotteries

31. The purchaser shall receive a ticket as a transaction record for one
or more chances to win an electronic ticket lottery once payment
has been processed.

32. Each electronically generated ticket shall contain the following:

(a) the name and email address of the licensee;
(b) the licence number;

(c) the draw location and date;

(d) the description, number and retail value of the prizes,
whether donated or purchased;

(e) the ticket number;
(f) the total number of tickets available for purchase;
(g) the selling price of the ticket;

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 336 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(h) the issue date and time in 24 hour format showing the hour
and minute that the ticket was issued;

(1) aunique validation number or barcode; and
() information on where the draw results will be available.
33. For electronic ticket lotteries where tickets are sold and the draw is

conducted on the same day at a single premises, the electronically
generated ticket shall contain the following:

(a) the name and email address of the licensee;

(b) the licence number;

(c) the ticket number;

(d) the selling price of the ticket;

(e) the issue date and time in 24 hour format showing the hour
and minute that the ticket was issued;

(f) aunique validation number or barcode;

(g)a raffle sales unit identifier from which the ticket was
generated;

(h) a statement that the winner must have winning ticket to
claim a prize; and

(1) the words “retain ticket until winner is confirmed”.

34. The electronic gaming equipment shall generate a unique
counterfoil for each ticket number. A counterfoil shall be printed
or entered electronically according to the type of draw to be
conducted. Printed counterfoils shall be the same size, shape and
weight. All counterfoils must have an equal chance of being
selected. A counterfoil shall contain the following:

(a) the name, email address and telephone number of the
purchaser;

(b) the event identifier;

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 337 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

(c) the licence number;
(d) the ticket number;

(e) the issue date and time in 24 hour format showing the hour
and minute that the ticket was issued; and

(f) a unique validation number or barcode.

35. For electronic ticket lotteries where tickets are sold and the draw is
conducted on the same day at a single premises the counterfoil
shall contain the following:

(a) the event identifier;
(b) the licence number;

(c) the ticket number;

(d) the issue date and time in 24 hour format showing the hour
and minute that the ticket was issued;

(e) a raffle sales unit identifier from which the ticket was
generated; and

(f) aunique validation number or barcode.

36. Multiple tickets may be sold for a discounted price. A unique
group number shall be printed on each discounted ticket,
corresponding to the price group from which the discounted ticket
was purchased.

37. Where a series of electronic ticket lotteries is conducted under a
single licence, tickets for each ticket draw shall be differentiated
from the other tickets used in the series.

38. Where a series of electronic ticket draws are conducted on the
same day at a single premises, the tickets sold for each draw shall
be uniquely identifiable from tickets sold for other draws
conducted on the same day.

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 338 May 31, 2024



Transitional

Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

39. Results of the electronic ticket lottery become official and final
after the winning ticket is verified by the licensee. The electronic
gaming equipment shall display the winning ticket number on all
capable display devices intended to be viewed by participants.

40. The licensee shall maintain a report that reconciles all electronic
ticket sales including sold, unsold and voided tickets for the
electronic ticket lottery purchase period, for a period of one year
from the date of the last draw.

19. Schedule E of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after rule 11 the following:

12. All claimed prizes shall be paid out before the end of the licence
period.

20. Schedule F of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after rule 19 the following:

20. All claimed prizes shall be paid out before the end of the
licence period.

21. (1) Schedule G of the regulations is amended by adding
immediately after rule 5 the following:

5.1 All claimed prizes shall be paid out before the end of the licence
period.

(2) Rule 14(f) of Schedule G of the regulations is repealed
and the following substituted:

(f) a place for the name, address, telephone number and email
address of the purchaser;

(3) Rule 15 of Schedule G of the regulations is repealed and
the following substituted:

15. Winners of prizes shall be notified of the results of the pool by
telephone, registered mail, email or in person.

22. A licence that was issued or an application that was
submitted before the coming into force of these regulations shall be

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 339 May 31, 2024



Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment) 32/24

subject to the regulations as they existed before the coming into
force of these regulations.

Commencement 23. These regulations come into force on July 2, 2024.

©King's Printer

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 340 May 31, 2024



H \‘."g
TR 1
YD L

NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR
REGULATION 33/24

Public Service Commission Act Schedule C Amendment Order, 2024
under the
Public Service Commission Act
(O.C. 2024-064)

(Filed May 31, 2024)

Under the authority of section 24 of the Public Service

Commission Act, the Lieutenant-Governor in Council makes the
following Order.

Dated at St. John’s, May 7, 2024.

Krista Quinlan
Clerk of the Executive Council

ORDER
Analysis

1. Short title 3. Repeal

2. RSNL1990 cP-43 Sch. C

Amdt.
The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 341

May 31, 2024



Public Service Commission Act Schedule C 33/24
Amendment Order, 2024

Short title 1. This Order may be cited as the Public Service Commission Act
Schedule C Amendment Order, 2024.

RSNL1990 cP-43 2. Schedule C of the Public Service Commission Act is amended

Sch. C Amdt. by deleting the statutory appointment reference "Economic
Diversification and Growth Enterprises Act, subsection 6(1)".

Repeal 3. The Public Service Commission Act Schedule C Amendment

Order, 2023 No. 2, Newfoundland and Labrador Regulation 43/23
is repealed.

©King's Printer

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette 342 May 31, 2024



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
May 31, 2024

Index
PART 1
Change Of NamME ACt — INOTICE ....c..etiuiiieiieiieiieeet ettt ettt ettt st bttt et ettt ebeeb e et e ebesbe st sbe e 209
LANAS ACT — NNOTICES ...t teuteteeieeeteeteeiteieette st ete s st et et e este et e eseeeseenseeseenseenee st enseeseensesseenseesaenseessenseensenseensesneensesneensennean 212
IMINETAL ACE — INOTICE ..veetentieieetiete et et ettt e st e e st es et es e et e e st e e st e et eneesseenseeseenseeseenseeseenseessenseensenseenseeneensesneensennean 210
TTUSEEE ACT — INOTICES ..eueiutieuiitieiietieteeite st e teste et e st e ea e et e eneeeseenseeseanseeaeesseenseeseenseeseenseeseenseessenseensenseenseeneensesneensennean 215
Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000 — NOEICE ....cc.evirtirierierieiiieieiieteieete ettt sttt ettt ettt ettt sae b sae e 212
PART II
CONTINUING INDEX OF SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION
Title of Act and
Subordinate Legislation NL Gazette
made thereunder NLR Amendment Date & Page No.

Criminal Code

Lottery Licensing Regulations 32/24 Amends May 31/24 p. 325

(Amendment) NLR 1/02

[In force July 2, 2024] S.2 Amdt.
S.3 R&S
S.4 Amdt.
S.8.1 Added
S.9 Amdt.
S.10 Amdt.
S.11 Amdt.
S.20 Amdt.
S.22 Amdt.
S.23 Amdt.
S.25 Amdt.
S.25.1 Added
S.28 R&S
S.35 R&S
S.36 R&S
Sch. A Amdt.
Sch. C Amdt.
Sch. D R&S
Sch. E Amdt.
Sch. F Amdt.
Sch. G Amdt.

Public Service Commission Act

Public Service Commission Act 33/24 R&S May 31/24 p.341
Schedule C Amendment Order, NLR 43/23
2024

343



THE NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADOR GAZETTE
January 26, 2024

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is published from the Office of the Kings’s Printer.

Copy for publication must be received by Friday, 4:30 p.m., seven days before publication date to ensure inclusion
in next issue.

Advertisements must be submitted in either PDF format or as a MSWord file. When this is not possible,
advertisements must be either, typewritten or printed legibly, separate from covering letter. Number of insertions
required must be stated and the names of all signing officers typewritten or printed.

Copy may be mailed to the address below, faxed to (709) 729-1900 or emailed to kingsprinter@gov.nl.ca.
Subscription rate for The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette is $144.38 for 52 weeks plus 15% HST ($166.04).
Weekly issues, $3.47 per copy, plus 15% HST ($3.99) payable in advance.

All cheques, money orders, etc., should be made payable to THE NEWFOUNDLAND EXCHEQUER ACCOUNT
and all correspondence should be addressed to: Office of the King’s Printer, P. O. Box 8700, Ground Floor, East
Block, Confederation Building, St. John’s, NL A1B 4J6, Telephone: (709) 729-3649, Fax: (709) 729-1900.

Web Site: www.gov.nl.ca/snl/printer/gazette/weekly-issues

The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette
Advertising Rates
Prices effective July 1, 2016

Notices Rate 15% HST Total
Lands Act - Notice of Intent - 1 week $31.13 $4.67 $35.80
Motor Carrier Act - Notice - 1 week $39.90 $5.99 $45.89
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 1 week $34.65 $5.20 $39.85
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 2 weeks $62.37 $9.36 $71.73
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 3 weeks $91.25 $13.69 $104.94
Trustee Act - Estate Notice - 4 weeks $118.97 $17.85 $136.82

All other public notices required by law to be published in The Newfoundland and Labrador Gazette, eg.,
Corporations Act, Municipalities Act, Quieting of Titles Act, Urban and Rural Planning Act, etc., are priced
according to size: for Single Column $3.47 per cm or Double Column $6.93 per cm, plus 15% HST.

For quotes please contact the Office of the King’s Printer kingsprinter@gov.nl.ca

Government Information Product
Publication Rate Mail
G.S.T. #R107442683

344



	https://www.gov.nl.ca/dgsnl/printer/gazette/weekly-issues/
	PART I
	CHANGE OF NAME ACT, 2009
	MINERAL ACTNOTICE
	URBAN AND RURALPLANNING ACT, 2000
	LANDS ACT
	TRUSTEE ACT

	PART II
	NEWFOUNDLAND AND LABRADORREGULATION 32/24Lottery Licensing Regulations (Amendment)
	REGULATION 33/24Public Service Commission Act Schedule C Amendment Order, 2024

	Index



